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• "Forgive" (Luke 6:37).

• "Love one another" (John 13:34).

Those are but a few of the scriptural

instructions clearly indicating that God's

peace is not to be hoarded. Rather, it is to

be shared liberally with our families, our

friends, and our communities. It is to be

shared with the Church as well as those

who are not members of our Church.

While those around us may not choose to

taste the sweetness and peace of the ful-

ness of the restored gospel for themselves,

surely they will be blessed by seeing it in

our lives and feeling the peace of the

gospel in our presence. The message of

peace will grow and expand through our

example.

"Live in peace," said the Apostle Paul,

"and the God of love and peace shall be

with you" (2 Corinthians 13:11).

I am grateful that I can witness to you

that Jesus is the Christ, and He is the Son
of God. By following Him in faith and
trust, all may find the sweet inner peace

the gospel offers to us as it has been taught

to us so beautifully during this confer-

ence. To this I humbly testify in the name
of Jesus Christ, amen.

President Monson

As we conclude this conference, we
express appreciation to the Tabernacle

Choir, the combined choir from the Logan
and Ogden institutes, and the men's choir

from BYU—Idaho, and their conductors

and organists, for the beautiful and inspir-

ing music.

We thank our city officials for the

cooperation given this conference; the

doctors, the Church Health Unit nurses,

and the ambulance services which have

been on hand to render assistance; the

ushers and interpreters; and those who
are responsible for the beautiful flowers

on Temple Square and in the Conference

Center.

We also express appreciation to local

and national media representatives for

their coverage of the conference and to

the owners and the operators of the many
radio and television stations, cable sys-

tems, and Internet service providers who
have given time and made facilities avail-

able to carry sessions of this conference in

many countries of the world.

As you leave the conference this af-

ternoon, we ask you to obey the traffic

rules, to use caution, and to be courte-

ous in driving.

President Gordon B. Hinckley, our

beloved prophet, will be our concluding

speaker. I testify to you, as one who
knows, that he is God's prophet here

upon the earth at this time. Following

President Hinckley's remarks, the choir

will sing "Abide with Me; 'Tis Eventide."

The benediction will then be offered by

Elder Bruce D. Porter of the Seventy, and

this conference will be adjourned for six

months.

President Gordon B. Hinckley

My beloved brethren and sisters, I

too would like to express deep apprecia-

tion for the tremendous service of Sister

Smoot, Sister Jensen, Sister Dew, and
their board, who have served so very faith-

fully and well in this great and tremendous

organization for women. It is a marvelous

society, 4,900,000 strong. There is nothing

like it, I think, in all the world, and it

touches for such tremendous good the

lives of women everywhere across the

earth. Thank you, dear sisters, for what

you've done. Welcome to you, Sister Par-

kin and your counselors, and the board

which you will select.

"Abide with me"

We now conclude this great confer-

ence. We have enjoyed a wonderful feast
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at the table of the Lord. We have been in-

structed in His ways after His pattern.

Each of us should be a little better for

this rich experience. Otherwise, our gath-

ering has been largely in vain.

When I conclude, the choir will sing:

Abide with me; 'tis eventide.

The day is past and gone;

The shadows of the evening fall;

The night is coming on.

Within my heart a welcome guest,

Within my home abide.

O Savior, stay this night with me;

Behold, 'tis eventide.

["Abide with Me; 'Tis Eventide,"

Hymns, no. 165]

That pretty well sums up the feelings

of our hearts as we return to our homes.

Jesus Christ is our central focus

May the Spirit of our Lord accom-

pany us and remain with us. We know not

what lies ahead of us. We know not what

the coming days will bring. We live in a

world of uncertainty. For some, there will

be great accomplishment. For others, dis-

appointment. For some, much of rejoicing

and gladness, good health, and gracious

living. For others, perhaps sickness and a

measure of sorrow. We do not know. But

one thing we do know. Like the polar star

in the heavens, regardless of what the fu-

ture holds, there stands the Redeemer of

the world, the Son of God, certain and sure

as the anchor of our immortal lives. He is

the rock of our salvation, our strength, our

comfort, the very focus of our faith.

In sunshine and in shadow we look to

Him, and He is there to assure and smile

upon us.

He is the central focus of our worship.

He is the Son of the living God, the First-

born of the Father, the Only Begotten in

the flesh, who left the royal courts on high

to be born as a mortal in the most humble

of circumstances. Of the loneliness of His

living He said, "The foxes have holes, and

the birds of the air have nests; but the Son

of man hath not where to lay his head"

(Matthew 8:20). He "went about doing

good" (Acts 10:38).

He was a man of miracles. He reached

out to those in distress. He healed the sick

and raised the dead. Yet for all of the love

He brought into the world, He was "de-

spised and rejected of men; a man of sor-

rows, and acquainted with grief: ... he was

despised," and was esteemed not (Isaiah

53:3).

We look upon His matchless life and

say with the prophet Isaiah:

"He hath borne our griefs, and car-

ried our sorrows. . .

.

".
. .He was wounded for our trans-

gressions, he was bruised for our iniqui-

ties: the chastisement of our peace was
upon him; and with his stripes we are

healed" (Isaiah 53:4-5).

When the great War in Heaven was
fought, Lucifer, the son of the morning,

came forth with a plan that was rejected.

The Father of us all, with love for us, His

children, offered a better plan under which

we would have freedom to choose the

course of our lives. His Firstborn Son, our

Elder Brother, was the key to that plan.

Man would have his agency, and with that

agency would go accountability. Man
would walk the ways of the world and sin

and stumble. But the Son of God would

take upon Himself flesh and offer Himself

a sacrifice to atone for the sins of all men.

Through unspeakable suffering He would

become the great Redeemer, the Savior of

all mankind.

With some small understanding of

that incomparable gift, that marvelous gift

of redemption, we bow in reverent love

before Him.

We rejoice in Christ

As a Church we have critics, many of

them. They say we do not believe in the

traditional Christ of Christianity. There is

some substance to what they say. Our
faith, our knowledge is not based on an-

cient tradition, the creeds which came of
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a finite understanding and out of the al-

most infinite discussions of men trying to

arrive at a definition of the risen Christ.

Our faith, our knowledge comes of the

witness of a prophet in this dispensation

who saw before him the great God of the

universe and His Beloved Son, the resur-

rected Lord Jesus Christ. They spoke to

him. He spoke with Them. He testified

openly, unequivocally, and unabashedly

of that great vision. It was a vision of the

Almighty and of the Redeemer of the

world, glorious beyond our understand-

ing but certain and unequivocating in the

knowledge which it brought. It is out of

that knowledge, rooted deep in the soil of

modern revelation, that we, in the words

of Nephi, "talk of Christ, we rejoice in

Christ, we preach of Christ, we prophesy

of Christ, and we write according to our

prophecies, that [we and] our children may
know to what source [we] may look for a

remission of [our] sins" (2 Nephi 25:26).

Testimony

And so, my brothers and sisters, as we
bid you good-bye for a season, we repeat

our firm and enduring testimony. We do

it as individuals with a sure and certain

knowledge. As I have said many times

before, and as I now say again, I know

that God our Eternal Father lives. He is

the great God of the universe. He is the

Father of our spirits, with whom we may
speak in prayer.

I know that Jesus Christ is His Only
Begotten Son, the Redeemer of the world,

who gave His life that we might have eter-

nal life and who rules and reigns with His

Father. I know that They are individual

beings, separate and distinct one from an-

other and yet alike in form and substance

and purpose. I know that it is the work of

the Almighty "to bring to pass the immor-
tality and eternal life of man" (Moses
1:39). I know that Joseph Smith was a

prophet, the great prophet of this dispen-

sation through whom these truths have

come. I know that this Church is the work
of God, presided over and directed by
Jesus Christ, whose holy name it bears.

Of these things I testify in solemnity

as I leave with you, my beloved associates,

my love and blessing, in the sacred name
of Jesus Christ, amen. "God be with you

till we meet again" (Hymns, no. 152).

The choir sang "Abide with Me; 'Tis

Eventide."

Elder Bruce D. Porter offered the

benediction.

SUMMARY OF CONFERENCE MUSIC
The Tabernacle Choir provided mu-

sic for the Saturday morning, Sunday
morning, and Sunday afternoon sessions.

Craig Jessop, Mack Wilberg, and Barlow

Bradford directed the choir. John Long-

hurst, Clay Christiansen, Richard Elliott,

Linda Margetts, and Bonnie Goodliffe

were the organists.

A combined choir from the Logan
and Ogden institutes provided music for

the Saturday afternoon session. Duane J.

Huff, Stephen Schank, and Jerald F. Si-

mon directed the choir, and Bonnie Good-
liffe was the organist.

A men's choir from BYU—Idaho
provided music for the priesthood session.

Kevin Brower and Randall Kempton di-

rected the choir, and Clay Christiansen

was the organist.

Throughout the conference sessions,

prelude, postlude, and interlude music

and accompaniments on the organ were
played by John Longhurst, Clay Chris-

tiansen, Richard Elliott, Linda Margetts,

and Bonnie Goodliffe.

F. Michael Watson
Clerk of the Conference


